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Dedication

Successful Sport Management, Third Edition, is dedicated to Dr. Guy Lewis, a
pioneer in sport administration at the University of Massachusetts and the Uni-
versity of South Carolina. His colleagues describe him as an outstanding author,
administrator, visionary, mentor, leader and scholar. His contributions to the
sport industry are recognized nationally and internationally and his accomplish-
ments have led sport administration programs into the 21st century. 

Herb Appenzeller
Tom Appenzeller
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Foreword

Herb and Tom Appenzeller have produced what amounts to the complete en-
cyclopedia of sport management. In the ever-expanding world of sport manage-
ment, this book provides critical information about the various components of
our profession. Successful Sport Management keeps abreast of the evolving roles
of technology and web-based influences while continuing to build upon its foun-
dation of management concepts throughout the sports industry. The book’s con-
tributors, who have been active in their respective fields, relate their vast experi-
ence and knowledge.

Whether the reader is considering a sports management career, a graduate
preparing for that first career opportunity, or individuals who have made this pro-
fession their life’s work, this book is an invaluable resource. The student consider-
ing a sport management career will discover a broad array of opportunities avail-
able in this profession. For the person just entering the field, the book is a
comprehensive resource. Seasoned veterans will be amazed by the breadth and
depth of the material which provides an opportunity for continual professional
growth.

Through this book, I expanded my knowledge and plan to refer to it often in
my day-to-day management of a collegiate athletic department.

Ron Wellman
Director of Athletics
Wake Forest University
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Introduction

Sport management started at Ohio University in 1966 and experienced un-
precedented growth among college students. The program became popular
among students, but one element was lacking—structured information necessary
for the new curriculum. Most professors depended on articles in magazines and
periodicals for material to meet the needs of the new program for the sport indus-
try.

In 1985, Dr. Guy Lewis and Dr. Herb Appenzeller decided to fill the void by
inviting 21 individuals with expertise and experience in various areas of sport
management to share their knowledge in a book designed for students in the field
and for the professors who taught in the new major. All of the 21 individuals
agreed to provide material in their areas of expertise, and the first edition of Suc-
cessful Sport Management became a reality. The textbook was well received by
sport management personnel, and several outstanding books were published to
provide valuable information for people interested in the sport industry.

In 2000 the second edition of Successful Sport Management was revised and
updated, and new chapters were included to meet the changing emphasis of sport
management.

The third edition, with 31 authors and 14 former students who are in the sport
industry, provide up-to-date information for the Conceptual Age, which is char-
acterized by today’s emphasis on social responsibility. A unique feature of the
third edition is that the textbook can be used for all levels, undergraduate and
graduate, of sport management programs. Each of the 33 chapters can stand on
its own, and the book has material for those who are attempting to conduct a job
search and need advice concerning resumes, interviews, networking, and other
valuable tips of the trade. We advise all students to keep the book handy during
their student days and for the future when they are practitioners in the sport in-
dustry. This text will provide valuable practical information for years to come.

Herb Appenzeller
Tom Appenzeller
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